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this in the name of the 'national interest', 
which makes it everyone's business. 
 
The result is that when cases like the Maple- 
thorpe affair come along, two things get con- 
fused. People who object aesthetically and 
morally to homo-erotic pictures can claim 
that they have the right to get them banned, 
for they are paying for them. Worse, those 
who want to show the pictures reply that any 
attempt to get their state hand-out withdrawn 
is an attack on their freedom of self-
expression, or free speech. The debate might 
go like this: 
 
Ghost of Maplethorpe. You are 
withdrawing my state subsidy as an attempt 
to suppress what I have to say as an artist. 
 
The State: Most people in this great nation 
of ours disapprove of this pornographic junk 
that masquerades as art. There is not a reason 
in the world why they should pay for it. 
 
Ghost of Maplethorpe: And yet you 
continue to fund the Van Gogh exhibition 
down the road. You fund the national ballet. 
You say they have a right to state subsidy, 
but you deny me the same right. You make 
this distinction only because you disapprove 
of what I do. You, the state, have no right to 
indulge in this kind of censorship. This is an 
attack on freedom of self-expression. 
 
It is of course an outrageous distortion to 
claim that withdrawing a handout is an attack 
on free speech. My right to say what I think 
(a right more imaginary than real in Britain 
today) has nothing to do with whether or not 
I get a state handout paying me to say it. But 
the Maplethorpe lobby can rightly claim that 
they are the victims of hypocrisy. Most 
American taxpayers are probably not 
interested in ballet, but have to pay for it. So 
it is hardly concern for what the taxpayer 
thinks that motivates the outraged politicians 
in their attack on the more controversial of 
the NEA's activities. 
 
There has not yet been a Maplethorpe-type 
scandal in the UK, though all the conditions 
for it exist (the Tate gallery bricks were 
offensive as a waste of money, but no more 
morally repugnant than the average Victorian  
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terraced house). But there are some 
similarities in the controversy over the 
infamous 'clause 28' which, among other 
things, prevents school-teachers from 
'promoting' homosexuality as a normal 
lifestyle to their pupils. The gay lobby 
describes this as the most ruthless oppression 
and, yes, an attack on free speech (or free ex- 
pression). This is more distortion. It is quite 
normal for a contract of employment to limit 
what an employee can say in the course of 
his job. We do not consider it an 
infringement of free speech that our doctor is 
not supposed to discuss our medical 
condition with the next patient who steps 
into his clinic. But the gay lobby can quite 
rightly ask (though it does not) why there is 
not a clause 27 prohibiting the promotion of 
heterosexual lifestyles as normal, or a clause 
29 preventing teachers from promoting racial 
equality as a right (the last of these would 
probably be at least as popular with the 
public at large as clause 28). Clearly the state 
is in the business of pushing its morals, and 
not all that worried about what the taxpayers 
think about where their money goes. 
 
This kind of controversy is the result of the 
state taking on roles which should be entirely 
in the hands of consumers. Some consumers 
will want their childrens' education to 
embody a liberal attitude on sexual mores, 
while others will not. Some will want to go 
and see Maplethorpe's pictures, others will 
never again visit a gallery that has the bad 
taste to show them. No state policy can ever 
accommodate diverse views like these, 
except perhaps the policy of 'no policy'. Only 
private provision can do that. And certainly, 
the gay lobby in the UK, and arts lobby in 
the US, sabotage their own case when they 
claim on the one hand that it is right for the 
state to subsidize the arts, or education, and 
then complain when the state takes a role in 
deciding what does and does not deserve its 
support. If you extol the virtues of the game, 
you have no grounds to complain when you 
lose by the rules. 

 


